
 

 

 

Telephone: 0151 529 6923 

Email: FOIRequests@liverpoolft.nhs.uk 

 

16 November 2021 

Our Ref: DS/JM/FOI 7867 

 

 

Dear Applicant, 

 

Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Request for Information Reference: FOI 7867 

 

Liverpool University Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust (LUHFT) is the name of our Trust and we 

operate four hospitals; Aintree University Hospital, Broadgreen Hospital, Liverpool University 

Dental Hospital and Royal Liverpool University Hospital. 

 

Further to your request for information received on 16 November 2021; please find the Trust’s 

response below. 

 

1. How many patients that were admitted to the hospital had received at least one covid-19 

vaccine, for each of the months below, for this year (2021). 

 

Jan Feb Mar Apr May Jun Jul Aug Sep Oct Nov Dec 

            

 

Section 1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA) – establish if information is held 

In accordance with Section 1 of the FOIA, we can confirm that the Trust does not hold/collate the 

above information as specifically as requested. 

 

We should explain that the FOIA is in relation to transparency of information held by public 

authorities and gives an individual the right to access recorded information held by public 

authorities.  

 

The FOIA does not require public authorities to create information, or to answer questions, 

provide explanations or give opinions, unless this is recorded information that they already hold. 
 

Section 40 of the FOIA – Personal Data 

In accordance with Section 40 of the FOIA, we can advise this information may be held within 

patients’ records. However, if we were to collate this information by searching an individual’s 

health record we would be in breach of the second data protection principle “Personal data must 

be used for specified/explicit purposes”. As this information was not provided to the Trust in order 

to facilitate FOIA responses we are withholding it under Section 40 (2). This is an absolute 

exemption meaning there is no requirement to consider the public interest when deciding whether 

/ or not to disclose. 
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2. How many patients that were admitted to the hospital had NOT vaccinated against covid-19, 

for each of the months below, for this year (2021). 

 

Jan Feb Mar Apr May Jun Jul Aug Sep Oct Nov Dec 

            

 

Section 1 of the FOIA – establish if information is held 

In accordance with Section 1 of the FOIA, we can confirm that the Trust does not hold/collate the 

above information as specifically as requested. 
 

Section 40 of the FOIA – Personal Data 

In accordance with Section 40 of the FOIA, we can advise this information may be held within 

patients’ records. However, if we were to collate this information by searching an individual’s 

health record we would be in breach of the second data protection principle “Personal data must 

be used for specified/explicit purposes”. As this information was not provided to the Trust in order 

to facilitate FOIA responses we are withholding it under Section 40 (2). This is an absolute 

exemption meaning there is no requirement to consider the public interest when deciding whether 

/ or not to disclose. 

 

3. How many patients that were admitted to the hospital that had received at least one covid-19 

vaccine died of any cause, for each of the months below, for this year (2021). 

 

Jan Feb Mar Apr May Jun Jul Aug Sep Oct Nov Dec 

            

 

Section 1 of the FOIA – establish if information is held 

In accordance with Section 1 of the FOIA, we can confirm that the Trust does not hold/collate the 

above information as specifically as requested. 
 

Section 40 of the FOIA – Personal Data 

In accordance with Section 40 of the FOIA, we can advise this information may be held within 

patients’ records. However, if we were to collate this information by searching an individual’s 

health record we would be in breach of the second data protection principle “Personal data must 

be used for specified/explicit purposes”. As this information was not provided to the Trust in order 

to facilitate FOIA responses we are withholding it under Section 40 (2). This is an absolute 

exemption meaning there is no requirement to consider the public interest when deciding whether 

/ or not to disclose. 

 

4. How many patients that were admitted to the hospital that were NOT vaccinated against 

covid-19 died of any cause, for each of the months below, for this year (2021). 

 

Jan Feb Mar Apr May Jun Jul Aug Sep Oct Nov Dec 

            

 

Section 1 of the FOIA – establish if information is held 

In accordance with Section 1 of the FOIA, we can confirm that the Trust does not hold/collate the 

above information as specifically as requested. 
 

 



 

Section 40 of the FOIA – Personal Data 

In accordance with Section 40 of the FOIA, we can advise this information may be held within 

patients’ records. However, if we were to collate this information by searching an individual’s 

health record we would be in breach of the second data protection principle “Personal data must 

be used for specified/explicit purposes”. As this information was not provided to the Trust in order 

to facilitate FOIA responses we are withholding it under Section 40 (2). This is an absolute 

exemption meaning there is no requirement to consider the public interest when deciding whether 

/ or not to disclose. 

 

5. How many patients that were admitted to the hospital that had received at least one covid-19 

vaccine died of covid-19, for each of the months below, for this year (2021). 

 

Jan Feb Mar Apr May Jun Jul Aug Sep Oct Nov Dec 

            

 

Section 1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA) – establish if information is held 

In accordance with Section 1 of the FOIA, we can confirm that the Trust does not hold the 

information you have requested. 
 

The Trust collates an individual’s date of death, not reason/cause of death; this would be 
recorded on their death certificate. The Trust does not have access to death certificates, these 
are held by the coroner. 
 

Section 16 of the FOIA – Duty to provide advice and assistance 

Under Section 16 of the FOIA, the Trust has a duty to provide advice and assistance and can 

confirm the Covid-19 deaths reporting that is completed is in line with the national definitions as 

set out by NHS England. For further information on submissions and publications please visit the 

following link: 

https://www.england.nhs.uk/statistics/statistical-work-areas/covid-19-daily-deaths/ 

 

6. How many patients that were admitted to the hospital that were NOT vaccinated against 

covid-19 died of covid-19, for each of the months below, for this year (2021). 

 

Jan Feb Mar Apr May Jun Jul Aug Sep Oct Nov Dec 

            

 

Section 1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA) – establish if information is held 

In accordance with Section 1 of the FOIA, we can confirm that the Trust does not hold the 

information you have requested. 
 

The Trust collates an individual’s date of death, not reason/cause of death; this would be 
recorded on their death certificate. The Trust does not have access to death certificates, these 
are held by the coroner. 
 

Section 16 of the FOIA – Duty to provide advice and assistance 

Under Section 16 of the FOIA, the Trust has a duty to provide advice and assistance and can 

confirm the Covid-19 deaths reporting that is completed is in line with the national definitions as 

set out by NHS England. For further information on submissions and publications please visit the 

following link: 

https://www.england.nhs.uk/statistics/statistical-work-areas/covid-19-daily-deaths/ 
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The Office for National Statistics provides figures based on all deaths registered involving Covid-

19 according to death certification, whether in or out of hospital settings. This includes cases 

where Covid-19 is mentioned on the death certificate, even if no test for the virus occurred. 

Because the ONS figures are derived from the formal process of death registration, the ONS 

guide states “there is usually a delay of at least 5 days between occurrence and registration”. 

Please see the following link for further information; 

https://www.ons.gov.uk/peoplepopulationandcommunity/healthandsocialcare/conditionsanddisea

ses 

 

7. How many births were there at the hospital for each of the months below, for this year (2021) 

 

Jan Feb Mar Apr May Jun Jul Aug Sep Oct Nov Dec 

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

 

Section 1 of the FOIA – establish if information held 

Please be advised that the Liverpool University Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust is an adult acute 

hospital and is not commissioned to provide obstetric/maternity/ante-natal services. Under 

Section 1a of the FOIA, we can confirm we do not hold the information required to answer this 

request. 
 

Section 16 of the FOIA – duty to provide advice and assistance 

In accordance with Section 16 of the FOIA, the Trust has a duty to provide advice and 

assistance. On this occasion may we advise contacting the Liverpool Women’s NHS Foundation 

Trust who provide these services for our area, their Freedom of Information Team can be 

contacted via: 
 

FOI@lwh.nhs.uk  

 

If you have any queries about this response or wish to discuss your request further please 

contact the Freedom of Information Team.  

 

Right to Review 

 

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request you have the right to ask for an internal 

review. 

To do this, please email FOIRequests@liverpoolft.nhs.uk and quote the reference number above. 

 

If you are not content with the outcome of the internal review, you may apply directly to the 

Information Commissioner for a decision. Generally, the ICO cannot make a decision unless you 

have exhausted the complaints procedure provided by the Trust. The Information Commissioner 

can be contacted at: The Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, 

Wilmslow, Cheshire SK9 5AF. 

 

Kind Regards 

 

Freedom of Information Team 

Liverpool University Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust 

FOIRequests@liverpoolft.nhs.uk 
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Please note that any individuals identified do not give consent for their personal data to be 

processed for the purposes of direct marketing.  

 
Re-use of Public Sector Information 

 
Where the Trust owns the copyright in information provided, you may re-use the information in 

line with the conditions set out in the Open Government Licence v3 which is available at 

http://www.nationalarchives.gov.uk/doc/open-government-licence/version/3/. Where information 

was created by third parties, you should contact them directly for permission to re-use the 

information. 

http://www.nationalarchives.gov.uk/doc/open-government-licence/version/3/

